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Dear Editor,

Mindsets for teaching and learning, I believe would be critical 
for both the teachers and learners. A growth mindset will 
definitely be essential for both the teachers and learners on a 
long-term basis to acquire sustained knowledge. Teachers have 
to collaborate with their colleagues to assess themselves and not 
shut their classrooms to run a solo show. Teachers should strive 
for strengthening their own methods of teaching rather than 
concentrating on the weaknesses and standards of the learners. 
A teacher should always have a positive mindset that all learners 
can learn and succeed. Students should develop interest toward 
learning and be constantly enthusiastic, hardworking and try to 
control their path to success. A previous study has shown that 
students with a sustained growth mindset get continuously 
motivated and showed increased efforts have outperformed 
those students with a fixed mindset [1]. Teachers cannot judge 
students based on some tests and should not categorize students 
based on their intelligence quotient. Teachers should not be 
judgmental about any of his/her students. Such mindset of a 
teacher who earmarks each student based on some kind of tests 
will not be helpful in encouraging learners. Teachers aim should 
be to build the growth mindset among learners, and avoid the 
fixed mindset that can trap them into a premature plateau and 
cause them to fall short of their unknowable potential. Eminent 
sociologist Benjamin Barber said that we should not divide this 
world in to weak and strong and neither based on one’s success 
or failures, rather we only find in this world two categories of 
people, the learners and non-learners.

In fact, I personally believe that humans are born learners as 
we see and learn so many things after the birth. No one is born 
brilliant and this you can understand by reading about the life 
of Thomas Ava Edison, the inventor of bulb light who was a 
normal school going child later became the inventor.

Dr. Carol Dweck, an eminent Stanford University psychologist, 
discovered the power of mindset and that there are only two 
types of mindset, the fixed and the growth mindset. It must be 
noted that to being a good teacher and a learner one needs to 
have a growth mindset. Teachers should never think that they 
have nothing further to learn and that it is the learners who are 
supposed to change in accordance to the teaching.

Alfred Binet, the inventor of the IQ Test, once said, “Without 
denying individual differences in children’s intellects, he 
believed that education and practice could bring about 
fundamental changes in intelligence.

A lesson for teachers: We have a great work to do. You can’t just 
sit in a seat and grow smart and that all students need to be 
challenged and nurtured. Teachers should always be fascinated 
with learning, with the process of discovering something new.

For students/Learners: None of you has ever failed. School 
may have failed you, but you have never failed. If you don’t 
give anything, do not expect anything. Success is not coming 
to you; you must come to it.” In conclusion, it must be noted 
that great teachers and good learners are not born but are 
produced over time. The fact that a small seed sowed and 
properly watered and looked after grows into a big tree should 
not be forgotten.
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